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A true First Growth of Rioja, the Viñedos y Bodegas Sierra Cantabria group is owned
and operated by the Eguren family. For over 150 years and through five generations,
the Eguren family has been at the forefront of Rioja's winemaking heritage,
pioneering single-vineyard expressions and elevating the region's terroir to new
heights. Rooted in the village of San Vicente de la Sonsierra, their journey began as
viticulturists, tending to the vines that would one day shape some of Spain's most
celebrated wines. With an unwavering dedication to Tempranillo, the family has
meticulously studied the microclimates, soils, and altitudes of their vineyards, crafting
wines that capture the purest expressions of this noble grape and timeless
village.Bodegas Sierra Cantabria, founded in 1957 by third-generation winemaker
Guillermo Eguren, was born from a vision to transform the family's exceptional
vineyards in San Vicente into world-class wines, following the tradition of Rioja's
aging classifications. Today, under the leadership of fourth-generation brothers
Marcos and Miguel Ángel Eguren, the estate continues to uphold its commitment to
estate-grown fruit, classic Rioja craftsmanship, and meticulous vineyard
management. Focused on traditionally classified Rioja wines—Crianza, Reserva, and
Gran Reserva—Bodegas Sierra Cantabria remains a benchmark for elegance Rioja
wines marked by the freshness and minerality of San Vicente de la Sonsierra.
Viñedos Sierra Cantabria, established in 2001, represents the family's deep
connection to their land, with an unwavering focus on single-vineyard, terroir-driven
wines. These bottlings highlight the unique microclimates and soils of San Vicente de
la Sonsierra and neighboring Labastida, resulting in an extraordinary collection of
wines that showcase the depth and diversity Tempranillo can achieve in the myriad
terroirs found within the Sonsierra Riojana. As of the 2024 vintage, the Egurens have
completed their magisterial property on the outskirts of San Vicente. An imposing
and monolithic structure built from solid blocks of sandstone extracted from the
mother rock, this cutting-edge winery hides one of Rioja's most confidential secrets -
over a kilometer of subterranean tunnels where the family carefully ages their most
treasured cuvées.fdjka;slThe fusion of these two legacies—classic and
contemporary—led to the creation of Viñedos y Bodegas Sierra Cantabria. This
unified portfolio celebrates the timeless tradition and innovative spirit of the Eguren
family. From structured, mineral-driven Tempranillos to complex, age-worthy whites,
each wine is a tribute to the land and the meticulous craftsmanship that defines the
family's winemaking philosophy.
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